

# Trumbull County - Sheriff

List of Sale Results  
For Sale Date:

**Thursday, May 30, 2019**

Case Number	Case Title
2016 SH 01562	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs BELL, DEBRA J</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE NO BID 1ST PURCHASER NAME NO BID
2018 SH 01638	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs BOWEN, TIMOTHY J</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE CANCELLED 1ST PURCHASER NAME CANCELLED
2016 SH 01180	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs CORNELL, SUELLEN</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE CANCELLED 1ST PURCHASER NAME CANCELLED
2018 SH 00979	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs DAGATI, ANTHONY</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 617.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$37,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME TMS LAND MANAGEMENT LLC
2018 SH 02011	<b>LAKEVIEW LOAN SERVICING, LLC vs DIBELL, TRAVIS W</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$30,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
2018 SH 00407	<b>WELLS FARGO USA HOLDINGS, INC. vs FITZPATRICK, TAWANNA</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$59,414.39 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
2017 SH 00842	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs HAMAD, ALHIMEED BILAL</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE CANCELLED 1ST PURCHASER NAME CANCELLED
2018 SH 01773	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs MADERITZ, HELEN</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 512.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$30,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME TMS LAND MANAGEMENT LLC
2018 SH 00590	<b>WELLS FARGO BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION, NOT IN ITS vs NELSON, HURREL G</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 137.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE CANCELLED 1ST PURCHASER NAME CANCELLED
2017 SH 02216	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs NICHOLAS, ROXANN M</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 437.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$25,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME TMS LAND MANAGEMENT LLC
2017 SH 01294	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs O'MEARA, T. MICHAEL</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 182.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$8,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME MICHAEL A BUTTER
2016 SH 00081	<b>DEUTSCHE BANK NATIONAL TRUST COMPANY, AS TRUSTEE F vs PLOTT, MARY ANN</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$112,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
2018 SH 01385	<b>THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON, F/K/A, THE BANK vs PRATT, KATHRYN</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEEES 527.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$31,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME M. WALKER INVESTMENTS, LLC

# Trumbull County - Sheriff

## List of Sale Results

For Sale Date:

**Thursday, May 30, 2019**

Case Number	Case Title
<b>2016 SH 01136</b>	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs SIMPSON, WILLIAM G</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE NO BID 1ST PURCHASER NAME NO BID
<b>2017 SH 01411</b>	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs SINGH, DARSHAN</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE CANCELLED 1ST PURCHASER NAME CANCELLED
<b>2017 SH 02010</b>	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs SPEELMAN, MELINDA</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 305.25 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$14,550.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME M&S LAND MANAGEMENT
<b>2018 SH 00828</b>	<b>PNC BANK, NATIONAL ASSOCIATION vs STROTHER, EMANUEL T</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$40,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
<b>2018 SH 01789</b>	<b>WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A. SUCCESSOR BY MERGER TO WELL vs TORRENCE, LISAI</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$14,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
<b>2018 SH 01849</b>	<b>BAYVIEW LOAN SERVICING, LLC vs UNKNOWN HEIRS OF MINOT L MOSHER, ET AL</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 62.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$14,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME PLAINTIFF
<b>2018 SH 00147</b>	<b>SAM LAMANCUSA, TREASURER vs WARREN SECURITY, LLC, ET AL</b> TOTAL SHERIFF COSTS/FEES 1412.00 1ST PURCHASER PRICE \$90,000.00 1ST PURCHASER NAME GUSTAVUS FIREWOODS & HARDWOODS LLC

-- end of report --